
• Sammi Grossman struggling with digestive issues                                                                                                                                                

• Robert Cassady : lung cancer  and kidney stones                                                                                                                                  

• Jim and Arlene Smith have several health concerns 

• Merle Rupp

• Emily and Bill Barron                                                                                                                                                  

• Lori Smith recovery from surgery, daily dialysis & waiting 

for kidney 

• Pat Gutherie - lung cancer                                  

• Paula Nulph has health issues                                                               

• Linda Fiscus has several health concerns

• Ray Umbaugh was diagnosed with Non-Hodgkin 

Lymphoma. He and Fay are both going through chemo.


• Bill McGaughey is recovering from knee replacement 
surgery.                                                                


• Brandon has severe back pain

• Ricky Kinney is undergoing testing for dementia.

• Keep praying for Steve’s eyes. He is recovering from 

cataract surgery.

• Tine is in the hospital in a unit for physical therapy.

• Keep Gabe and Elizabeth in prayer for their new marriage

• Pray for all of our graduates as they each embark on their 

new journey and also for the safety of those who are 
college-bound.


• Jim Graham is doing better, but his numbers are down, 
therefore he has to wait for treatment.                                   


• Bob Kizer, friend of Tommy Sellers has throat and lung 
cancer                                                                                                               


• Jo Kerlin Corbett, family of Renee Cassady is battling 
breast cancer                                                                              


• Nolan & Sammi’s friends son, Leo, age 3 has Kidney 
Cancer that is metastatic.                               


• Jacque’s friend found out her sister has untreatable 
pancreatic cancer                                                                                                                                                                                             


• Mary’s friend Debbie Parsy, bowel & liver cancer                      

• Samantha, friend of Bill McGaughey’s daughter, breast 

cancer

• Angel and Alana’s father, Steve, has nose cancer and will 

need a total of 4 reconstructive surgeries.

• Joe Caruso, friend of Randy Grossman

• KP, friend of Randi Lynn, has stage 4 prostate cancer. He 

is a young man with a preschooler at home.

• Robin’s uncle, Jim Penvose, will be starting radiation.

• Dawn Cowles from Valley Cities church of Christ, has 

cancer.

• Sara Green, one of Frank and Lorrie’s Tipton Home girls, 

who is 32 now, has been having multiple health issues 
and has had a stroke                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                              


• Angel’s Uncle Jason dealing with addiction                                                                                                                                                                           


• Laurie’s niece and nephew Theresa and David: anxiety 
and depression                                                                                                                                         


• Russ’s brother Gary Adam, degenerative artery disease 
with no cure     


• Alda’s friend Tom Iseman, on dialysis & is on the list for a 
kidney transplant


• Brian Steffy’s cousin’s father-in-law, Jerry Karr is still 
struggling with breathing.


• Brian’s friend, Kenny Wagner, has burns on his hands and 
face. He has had some success with the skin grafts. He 
will have future skin surgeries.


• Mike Gutherie has been deployed to Africa. Pray for his 
family and his safety


• Mary Laird’s neighbor, Tim McCollough has Dementia 
and Alzheimer’s. His condition has worsened. Pray for his 
wife, Lisa, his caretaker


• Abby is a senior in high school who has been diagnosed 
with Crohn’s disease


• Rodney Priester finished his treatments. No evidence of 
any tumors. He will still need an operation at the end of 
September. He has some scar tissue causing some issues.


• Bill McGaughey’s nephew, Dustin Clark, has prostate 
cancer that seems to have spread to his spine.


• Sherry Farster's son, John Harvey, was diagnosed with 
testicular cancer. Please pray for his upcoming tests


• River Schafer, a 5-year-old with Leukemia, has been in 
and out of the hospital. Needs a bone marrow transplant.
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• Marshall Moore Sr. from Indiana CoC, has terminal 
Glioblastoma, a fast-growing and aggressive brain tumor


• Pray for Harmony’s teacher, Mrs. Richardson, to have a 
healthy pregnancy.


• Susan Lees coworker, Madison, is struggling with 
relationships and children.


• Susan’s niece, Renee Lukehart, who lost her vision due to 
vaccinations, is now a world-wide case study. She has a 
new doctor. Pray that he can find a cure.


• Stephanie’s grandfather, Dave Allen, is 89 and has no 
energy. He is not eating very much and keeps falling.


• Laurie Barron’s co-worker, Christina, is suffering from MS

• Rich Patterson had his leg amputated

• Cathy’s sister, Patty, experienced a mental health crisis and 

is currently receiving care in the hospital/rehab.

• Mary Laird’s friend, Kay Craignor, had double surgeries-

neck and back surgery. Pray for her recovery.

• Tom’s friend Ann Hetrick is still in severe neck and back 

pain.

• Tom’s friend, Beth Bowlan, had hip surgery on right hip. 

Please pray for her recovery.

• Barb’s sister-in-law, Terri Bertino, has stage 4 lung cancer. 

• A friend of Val asked that we pray for Sierra, who has 

Ewing’s Sarcoma. 

• Trenton Buzard, a 16 yr old student from Redbank, is in 

Children's and severely ill. He will need 3 amputations.

• Jill’s friend Wendy is grieving over the loss of her 

husband. Please pray for comfort.

• Ricky Lake, a friend of the Waltenbaughs, is recovering 

from cancer treatments and it has taken a terrible toll on 
his body. He is still suffering most days.


• Teresa, a friend of the Waltenbaughs, a breast cancer 
survivor, now has a mass on her lungs. 


• Please pray for the unity of our country and for our leaders.

• As always, pray for Brandon, the elders, deacons and Bible 

class teachers!


• The Smith family is going through a hard time. Please pray 
for them.


• We are thankful for our new friend Joy Carr. Please pray 
that she settles into her new place and that we have the 
opportunity to get to know her better.


• Sally’s brother-in-law, Gary Stear, needs prayer.

• Dave, from the church in Blairsville, is asking for prayers 

for his 1 month old grandson, Vinnie. There is a chance he 
has cystic fibrosis.


• Heather’s mom, Dawn Vogt, has emphysema and COPD, 
just found out she has a large black spot on her lungs, a 
blood clot in her stomach and a large mass behind her 
uterus. Please be in prayer for her and the family.


• Erin Lawson friend of Randi Lynn Grossman, is in need of 
prayers for her family.


•  Ambers aunt, Jennifer, who had the heart transplant, is 
having rejection issues.


• Linda Fiscus: Kidney is getting better. She is not breathing 
well. She is having a lot of pain in her back. 


• Fay’s cousin, Lucy Secka, is in kidney failure and on 
dialysis. 


• Surgery on Larry Rupp's neck/spine went well. Dr had to 
remove a piece of bone to relieve the nerve pressure. Pray 
it helps his pain


• Please pray for Lorrie Ridenours friend Debbie Graham. 
She had emergency surgery for diverticulitis.


• Joy Carr is asking for prayers for her friend, Miracle, who is 
hospitalized with Covid-19. 

• Brice, a member of Alana’s marching band, has lost his 
father after a long battle with several illnesses. Please pray 
for the Sheuy family


• Josh Temchulla’s wife, Maria, lost her life to suicide. Please 
pray for her family. 


• Fay’s niece, Denise, lost her sister. Please pray for her 
family. 

Those Who Have Recently Lost Loved Ones


